Bid Tab

Northern Kentucky Water District
District Vehicle 2019 Bid

March 26, 2019

11:00 AM
UNIT PRICE SCHEDULE (Includes unit price per item- for more details and exceptions, see full bid sheet)
Number of Units 1 1 1 2 2 2 4 1
3 /4 TON HEAVY DUT
20-TON DUMP TRUCK - CAB & | COMPACT 4X4 PICKUP| COMPACT 4X2 PICKUP| (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK |3 /4 TON HEAVY DUTY 1 /2 TON PICKUP
EQUIPMENT |CHASSIS WITH DUMP | TRUCK WITH TRUCK WITH WITH COVERED (4 x 4) PICKUP TRUCK | TRUCK 4X4 WITH VACUUM Add.
Company DRAG BED EXTENDED CAB EXTENDED CAB UTILITY BODY WITH EXTENDED CAB | EXTENDED CAB EXCAVATOR No. 1
No Bid $95,648.00 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Fyda Freightliner yes
No Bid No Bid $22,350.00 $20,500.00 No Bid No Bid $30,450.00 No Bid
Downtown Nashville Nissan no
No Bid No Bid $26,238.00 $24,405.00 $42,499.00 $30,938.00 $27,540.00 No Bid
Haag Ford Sales yes
No Bid No Bid $25,669.62 $23,936.62 $44,408.74 $28,499.74 $26,399.62 No Bid
Beechmont Ford yes
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $47,555.00 $38,030.00 $24,605.00 No Bid
Zimmer Motor Inc. yes
341,802.85- 6
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $341, <
Jack Doheny Companies, Inc. $352,709.44- 9cy yes
No Bid No Bid $27,578.50 $25,441.30 $43,935.50 $32,267.00 $29,134.00 No Bid
Fuller Ford Inc. yes
101,785.00
No Bid $101, No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Kenworth of Cincinnati / Palmer Trucks $113,999.00 no
No Bid No Bid $28,833.20 $25,198.40 No Bid No Bid $28,854.30 No Bid
Herlinger Motors, Inc. yes
No Bid No Bid $27,917.00 $23,629.00 $45,089.00 $30,440.00 $29,138.00 No Bid
McCluskey Chevrolet yes
No Bid No Bid $26,295.00 $24,665.00 No Bid $30,493.00 $27,549.00 No Bid
Tim Short Ford of Morehead mo




