

	SES Infrastructure Services LLC	Seven Brothers Painting Inc.	Utility Service Co. Inc.	Worldwide Industries Corp.	TMI Coatings, Inc.	D&M Painting Corporation	L. C. United Painting Co. Inc.	UCL, Inc.	Currens Construction Services, LLC	George Kountoupes Painting Co.
Part A- Devon Tank Only										
Lump Sum Total- Part A	\$ 333,736.00	\$ 638,500.00	\$ 686,800.00	\$ 578,820.00	\$ 811,700.00	\$ 885,300.00	\$ 916,500.00	\$ 875,800.00	\$ 1,196,750.00	\$ 705,000.00
Part B- Harrison Tank Only										
Lump Sum Total- Part B	\$ 107,500.00	\$ 74,600.00	\$ 95,000.00	\$ 69,200.00	\$ 107,200.00	\$ 65,100.00	\$ 78,000.00	\$ 87,000.00	\$ 121,400.00	No Bid
Part C- Rossford Tank Only										
Lump Sum Total- Part C	\$ 334,789.00	\$ 299,200.00	\$ 300,000.00	\$ 408,000.00	\$ 386,300.00	\$ 532,240.00	\$ 476,000.00	\$ 630,000.00	\$ 477,000.00	No Bid
Part D- South Newport Tank Only										
Lump Sum Total- Part D	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 31,300.00	\$ 31,200.00	\$ 40,840.00	\$ 39,800.00	\$ 15,600.00	\$ 31,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 29,200.00	No Bid
Part E- Devon, Harrison, Rossord AND South Newport Tank										
Part A	\$ 333,736.00	\$ 638,500.00	\$ 686,800.00	\$ 578,820.00	\$ 811,700.00	\$ 885,300.00	\$ 916,500.00	\$ 875,800.00	\$ 1,196,750.00	No Bid
Part B	\$ 107,500.00	\$ 74,600.00	\$ 85,000.00	\$ 69,200.00	\$ 107,200.00	\$ 65,100.00	\$ 78,000.00	\$ 87,000.00	\$ 121,400.00	No Bid
Part C	\$ 334,789.00	\$ 299,200.00	\$ 300,000.00	\$ 408,000.00	\$ 386,300.00	\$ 532,240.00	\$ 476,000.00	\$ 630,000.00	\$ 477,000.00	No Bid
Part D	\$ 16,500.00	\$ 31,300.00	\$ 21,200.00	\$ 40,840.00	\$ 39,800.00	\$ 15,600.00	\$ 31,000.00	\$ 12,000.00	\$ 29,200.00	No Bid
	\$ 792,525.00	\$ 1,043,600.00	\$ 1,093,000.00	\$ 1,096,860.00	\$ 1,345,000.00	\$ 1,498,240.00	\$ 1,501,500.00	\$ 1,604,800.00	\$ 1,824,350.00	\$ -