

Note: All blanks on this sheet shall be completed by printing or by typewriter. A bid price shall be indicated for each item listed or the words "No Bid" or "Not Applicable" entered. **NO HANDWRITTEN BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED.**

2019 Bid Item #	2018 Bid Item #	Part ID	MWD QTY.	BCW QTY.	TOTAL QTY.	ITEM	Consolidated Pipe				Core & Main				Ferguson				Florence Winwater				Fortline				Viking				DeZURIK, Inc.			
							MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)	MANUFACTURER	CATALOG # PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
1	1	400	2000	100	2100	3/4" Corporation Stops (Flare Ball Type)	FORD	FB600-3-NL	\$31.93	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74701B	\$ 30.79	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-600-3-NL	\$31.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB600-3-NL	\$ 32.45	7-10 Days	FORD	FB600-3-NL	\$ 32.12	7-14 days	FORD	FB600-3-NL	\$ 32.12	7-14 days				
2	5	17	200	40	240	1" Corporation Stops (Flare Ball Type)	FORD	FB600-4-NL	\$40.99	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74701B	\$ 41.08	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-600-4-NL	\$40.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB600-4-NL	\$ 41.66	7-10 Days	FORD	FB600-4-NL	\$ 41.23	7-14 days	FORD	FB600-4-NL	\$ 41.23	7-14 days				
3	6	129	50	50	50	1-1/2" Corporation Stops (Flare Ball Type)	FORD	FB600-6-NL	\$97.49	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74701B	\$ 97.27	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-600-6-NL	\$96.89	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB600-6-NL	\$ 98.59	7-10 Days	FORD	FB600-6-NL	\$ 98.09	7-14 days	FORD	FB600-6-NL	\$ 98.09	7-14 days				
4	7	249	50	4	54	2" Corporation Stops (Flare Ball Type)	FORD	FB600-7-NL	\$169.90	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74701B	\$ 169.90	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-600-7-NL	\$ 173.10	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB600-7-NL	\$ 172.24	7-10 Days	FORD	FB600-7-NL	\$ 171.35	7-14 days	FORD	FB600-7-NL	\$ 171.35	7-14 days				
5	8	399	600	10	610	3/4" Corporation 90 Bend (swivel)	FORD	L02-335-NL	\$18.00	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74776S	\$ 18.05	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-335-NL	\$17.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	L02-335-NL	\$ 18.30	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-335-NL	\$ 18.29	7-14 days	FORD	L02-335-NL	\$ 18.29	7-14 days				
6	9	16	150	10	160	1" Corporation 90 Bend (swivel)	FORD	L02-445-NL	\$25.43	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74776S	\$ 25.48	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-445-NL	\$ 26.40	1-10 DAYS	Ford	L02-445-NL	\$ 25.83	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-445-NL	\$ 25.82	7-14 days	FORD	L02-445-NL	\$ 25.82	7-14 days				
7	10	128	25	25	25	1-1/2" Corporation 90 Bend (swivel)	FORD	L02-665-NL	\$74.39	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74776S	\$ 74.60	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-665-NL	\$73.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	L02-665-NL	\$ 75.62	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-665-NL	\$ 75.62	7-14 days	FORD	L02-665-NL	\$ 75.62	7-14 days				
8	11	248	25	4	29	2" Corporation 90 Bend (swivel)	FORD	L02-775-NL	\$130.36	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74776S	\$ 130.71	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-775-NL	\$129.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	L02-775-NL	\$ 132.50	7-10 Days	FORD	L02-775-NL	\$ 132.50	7-14 days	FORD	L02-775-NL	\$ 132.50	7-14 days				
9	2	BCW	600	600	600	3/4" Corporation (CTS Ball Type)	FORD	FB1000-3-Q-NL	\$32.90	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74718T	\$ 32.98	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-1000-3-Q-NL	\$32.90	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB1000-3-Q-NL	\$ 33.46	7-10 Days	FORD	FB1000-3-Q-NL	\$ 33.28	7-14 days	FORD	FB1000-3-Q-NL	\$ 33.28	7-14 days				
10	3	BCW	50	50	50	1" Corporation (CTS Ball Type)	FORD	FB1000-4-Q-NL	\$43.27	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74718T	\$ 43.39	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-1000-4-Q-NL	\$43.30	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB1000-4-Q-NL	\$ 43.99	7-10 Days	FORD	FB1000-4-Q-NL	\$ 43.98	7-14 days	FORD	FB1000-4-Q-NL	\$ 43.98	7-14 days				
11	4	BCW	20	20	20	2" Corporation (CTS Ball Type)	FORD	FB1000-7-Q-NL	\$160.75	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	74718T	\$ 160.87	7-10 Days	FORD	FB-1000-7-Q-NL	\$160.59	1-10 DAYS	Ford	FB1000-7-Q-NL	\$ 163.08	7-10 Days	FORD	FB1000-7-Q-NL	\$ 163.00	7-14 days	FORD	FB1000-7-Q-NL	\$ 163.00	7-14 days				
12	12	424	20	20	20	3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-303	\$19.19	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 19.04	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-303	\$18.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-303	\$ 19.39	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-303	\$ 19.39	7-14 days	FORD	S70-303	\$ 19.39	7-14 days				
13	13	51	10	10	10	1" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-304	\$19.19	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 19.04	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-304	\$18.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-304	\$ 19.39	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-304	\$ 19.39	7-14 days	FORD	S70-304	\$ 19.39	7-14 days				
14	14	57	10	10	10	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-404	\$22.55	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 22.40	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-404	\$22.59	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-404	\$ 22.83	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-404	\$ 22.83	7-14 days	FORD	S70-404	\$ 22.83	7-14 days				
15	15	58	25	25	25	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-540-CC4	\$62.86	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 63.87	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-540-CC4	\$62.77	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-540-CC4	\$ 63.67	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-540-CC4	\$ 63.67	7-14 days	FORD	2028-540-CC4	\$ 63.67	7-14 days				
16	16	800	5	5	5	1/2" x 1 1/2" cc Brass Service Saddle	FORD	2028-540-CC6	\$72.95	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 74.50	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-540-CC6	\$72.97	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-540-CC6	\$ 74.26	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-540-CC6	\$ 74.25	7-14 days	FORD	2028-540-CC6	\$ 74.25	7-14 days				
17	17	801	5	5	5	1/2" x 1 1/2" cc Brass Service Saddle SDR-21	FORD	S70-406	\$48.65	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 48.21	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-406	\$48.49	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-406	\$ 49.16	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-406	\$ 49.15	7-14 days	FORD	S70-406	\$ 49.15	7-14 days				
18	18	306	25	25	25	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-540-CC7	\$79.79	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 81.10	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-540-CC7	\$78.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-540-CC7	\$ 80.83	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-540-CC7	\$ 80.83	7-14 days	FORD	2028-540-CC7	\$ 80.83	7-14 days				
19	19	433	10	10	10	3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-603	\$33.51	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 33.40	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-603	\$33.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-603	\$ 34.06	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-603	\$ 34.06	7-14 days	FORD	S70-603	\$ 34.06	7-14 days				
20	21	434	25	10	35	1/2" x 3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-750-CC3	\$73.81	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 75.32	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC3	\$73.49	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-750-CC3	\$ 74.59	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC3	\$ 74.58	7-14 days	FORD	2028-750-CC3	\$ 74.58	7-14 days				
21	22	431	250	250	250	1/2" x 3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, CS90	FORD	S90-603	\$33.51	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 33.40	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-603	\$33.48	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S90-603	\$ 34.06	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-603	\$ 33.80	7-14 days	FORD	S90-603	\$ 33.80	7-14 days				
22	24	60	100	100	100	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, CS90	FORD	S90-604	\$33.51	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 33.40	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-604	\$33.48	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S90-604	\$ 34.06	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-604	\$ 33.80	7-14 days	FORD	S90-604	\$ 33.80	7-14 days				
23	26	61	10	10	10	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-604	\$33.51	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 33.40	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-604	\$33.48	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-604	\$ 34.06	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-604	\$ 33.80	7-14 days	FORD	S70-604	\$ 33.80	7-14 days				
24	28	63	25	25	25	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-750-CC4	\$73.81	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 75.32	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC4	\$73.48	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-750-CC4	\$ 74.59	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC4	\$ 74.88	7-14 days	FORD	2028-750-CC4	\$ 74.88	7-14 days				
25	29	162	5	5	5	1/2" x 1 1/2" cc Brass Service Saddle, CS90	FORD	S90-606	\$63.26	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 63.04	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-606	\$62.88	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S90-606	\$ 64.27	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-606	\$ 63.93	7-14 days	FORD	S90-606	\$ 63.93	7-14 days				
26	30	NO #	5	5	5	1/2" x 1 1/2" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-606	\$63.26	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 63.04	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-606	\$62.88	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-606	\$ 64.27	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-606	\$ 63.93	7-14 days	FORD	S70-606	\$ 63.93	7-14 days				
27	31	NO #	10	10	10	1/2" x 1 1/2" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-750-CC6	\$84.41	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 86.00	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC6	\$83.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-750-CC6	\$ 85.74	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC6	\$ 85.28	7-14 days	FORD	2028-750-CC6	\$ 85.28	7-14 days				
28	32	312	20	20	20	1/2" x 2" cc Brass Service Saddle, CS90	FORD	S90-607	\$63.41	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 63.04	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-607	\$62.88	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S90-607	\$ 64.27	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-607	\$ 63.89	7-14 days	FORD	S90-607	\$ 63.89	7-14 days				
29	34	319	10	10	10	1/2" x 2" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-607	\$63.41	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 63.04	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-607	\$62.88	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-607	\$ 64.27	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-607	\$ 63.93	7-14 days	FORD	S70-607	\$ 63.93	7-14 days				
30	36	308	10	5	15	1/2" x 2" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-750-CC7	\$92.76	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 94.50	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC7	\$92.88	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-750-CC7	\$ 94.22	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-750-CC7	\$ 93.73	7-14 days	FORD	2028-750-CC7	\$ 93.73	7-14 days				
31	37	436	5	5	5	3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-962-CC3	\$91.63	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 93.11	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-962-CC3	\$91.40	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-962-CC3	\$ 92.82	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-962-CC3	\$ 92.82	7-14 days	FORD	2028-962-CC3	\$ 92.82	7-14 days				
32	38	435	1000	1000	1000	1/2" x 3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, CS90	FORD	S90-803	\$46.90	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 45.86	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-803	\$46.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S90-803	\$ 47.67	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-803	\$ 47.17	7-14 days	FORD	S90-803	\$ 47.17	7-14 days				
33	41	64	100	100	100	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, CS90	FORD	S90-804	\$46.90	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3805	\$ 46.76	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-804	\$46.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S90-804	\$ 47.67	7-10 Days	FORD	S90-804	\$ 47.17	7-14 days	FORD	S90-804	\$ 47.17	7-14 days				
34	43	66	10	5	15	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, D.I.	FORD	2028-962-CC4	\$91.39	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3825	\$ 93.11	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-962-CC4	\$90.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	2028-962-CC4	\$ 92.82	7-10 Days	FORD	2028-962-CC4	\$ 92.82	7-14 days	FORD	2028-962-CC4	\$ 92.82	7-14 days				
35	44	65	30	30	30	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, SDR-21	FORD	S70-804	\$46.06	7-21 Days	AY McDonald	3801	\$ 45.90	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-804	\$45.98	1-10 DAYS	Ford	S70-804	\$ 46.80	7-10 Days	FORD	S70-804	\$ 46.79	7-14								

2018 Bid Item #	2019 Bid Item #	Part ID	QTY	UNIT	TOTAL QTY	ITEM
61	40	BCW	10	10	10	1/2" x 3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle, 50R-21 (1-piece, hinged)
62	42	BCW	20	20	20	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, C300 (1-piece, hinged)
63	45	BCW	10	10	10	1/2" x 1" cc Brass Service Saddle, 50R-21 (1-piece, hinged)
64	51	BCW	10	10	10	1/2" x 2" cc Brass Service Saddle, C300 (1-piece, hinged)
65	53	BCW	0	0	0	1/2" x 2" cc Brass Service Saddle, 50R-21 (1-piece, hinged)
66	55	BCW	6	6	6	1/2" x 3/4" cc Brass Service Saddle C300 (1-piece, hinged)
67	67	509	2000	2000	2000	1/8" Yoke Bar
68	68	501	12000	12000	12000	1/8" Angle Valve (Flared) Ball Type
69	69	502	50	50	50	1/8" Angle Valve I.P. Ball Type
70	70	516	300	100	100	1/8" Yoke Ell (Flared)
71	71	517	50	50	50	1/8" Yoke Ell I.P.
72	72	504	7500	7500	7500	1/8" Expansion Wheels
73	73	BCW	600	600	600	1/8" x 1/4" Setter
74	74	67	50	50	50	1" Yoke Bar
75	75	4	200	200	200	1" Angle Valve (Flared) Ball Type
76	76	5	20	20	20	1" Angle Valve I.P. Ball Type
77	77	68	25	25	25	1" Yoke Ell (Flared)
78	78	70	20	20	20	1" Yoke Ell I.P.
79	79	22	100	100	100	1" Expansion Wheels
80	80	BCW	50	50	50	1" Setter
81	81	113	10	10	10	1-1/2" Angle Valve, (Flared) Ball Type
82	82	235	10	10	10	2" Angle Valve, (Flared) Ball Type
83	83	124	50	50	50	1-1/2" Copper Setter
84	84	244	30	30	30	2" Copper Setter
85	New	20	20	20	20	1-1/2" Copper Re-Setter
86	New	20	20	20	20	2" Copper Re-Setter
87	85	BCW	10000	10000	10000	1/4" GASKET
88	86	BCW	100	100	100	1" GASKET
89	87	BCW	12	12	12	1 1/2 GASKET (DROP IN TYPE)
90	88	BCW	50	50	50	2" GASKET (DROP IN TYPE)
91	89	227	2500	600	3100	18" x 24 Meter Vaults (Ultra Rib)
92	90	340	100	100	200	24" x 24 Meter Vaults (Ultra Rib)
93	91	736	60	25	85	30" x 30 Meter Vaults (Ultra Rib)
94	92	742	300	200	500	1" Meter Vault Extensions
95	93	741	300	50	350	1/2" Meter Vault Extensions
96	94	743	100	100	100	18" Meter Cover (heavy duty, touch read)
97	95	745	2000	2000	2000	18" Meter Cover (touch read)
98	96		100	100	100	Metal Lid (One Hole)
99	97		20	20	20	Metal Lid (Two Hole)
100	New	BCW	300	300	300	Composite Lid (One Hole)
101	98		500	500	500	18" Ring and Lid Set
102	New	BCW	100	100	100	18" Composite Ring and Lid Set
103	99		25	25	25	21" Ring and Lid Set
104	New	BCW	100	100	100	21" Ring Only
105	100	744	50	50	50	30" Monitor Lid and Ring
106	101	737	50	60	110	18" x 24" Extension Ring
107	102	738	10	50	60	18" x 30" Extension Ring
108	103	739	40	40	40	30" x 24" Extension Ring (Monitor Cover Flange)
109	104	740	40	40	40	30" x 30" Extension Ring (Monitor Cover Flange)
110	105	393	250	10	260	3/4" Copper to Copper
111	106	387	20	10	30	1/4" x 1" Copper to Copper
112	107	386	20	20	20	3/4" Copper to 1/2" Iron (male)
113	108	11	20	10	30	1" Copper to Copper
114	109	23	25	25	25	1" Flare x 1/2" Copper Piggyback
115	110	796	5	5	5	1-1/2" Copper to Copper 90
116	111	232	5	5	5	2" Copper to Copper 90
117	112	125	10	10	10	1-1/2" Copper to Copper
118	113	245	10	5	15	2" Copper to Copper
119	114	391	50	50	50	3/4" Copper x 1/2" FIP
120	115	388	50	50	50	3/4" Copper x 1" FIP
121	116	NO #	800	10	810	3/4" Copper x Compression

MANUFACTURER	CATALOG or PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
FORD	570-803	\$46.29	7-21 Days
FORD	590-804	\$47.17	7-21 Days
FORD	570-804	\$46.20	7-21 Days
FORD	590-807	\$72.59	7-21 Days
FORD	570-807	\$65.57	7-21 Days
FORD	590-1203	\$137.19	7-21 Days
FORD	Y501	\$7.83	7-21 Days
FORD	BA92-213W-NL	\$30.26	7-21 Days
FORD	BA91-213W-NL	\$25.69	7-21 Days
FORD	L92-13-NL	\$9.42	7-21 Days
FORD	L91-13-NL	\$6.47	7-21 Days
FORD	EC-1-NL	\$12.01	7-21 Days
FORD	VBHC72-12W-MM-33-NL	\$115.99	7-21 Days
FORD	Y504	\$14.88	7-21 Days
FORD	BA92-444W-NL	\$75.20	7-21 Days
FORD	BA91-444W-NL	\$65.81	7-21 Days
FORD	L92-44-NL	\$16.59	7-21 Days
FORD	L91-44-NL	\$11.44	7-21 Days
FORD	EC-4-NL	\$22.90	7-21 Days
FORD	VBHC74-15W-MM-44-NL	\$221.25	7-21 Days
FORD	BFA23-666W-NL	\$171.85	7-21 Days
FORD	BFA23-777W-NL	\$218.59	7-21 Days
FORD	VB876-15B-11-66-NL	\$650.00	7-21 Days
FORD	VB877-15B-11-77-NL	\$730.95	7-21 Days
FORD	VB846-14B	\$917.40	7-21 Days
FORD	VB847-14B-NL	\$999.00	7-21 Days
FORD	GT-114	\$0.18	7-21 Days
FORD	GT-120	\$0.19	7-21 Days
FORD	GT-140	\$1.52	7-21 Days
FORD	GT-141	\$1.72	7-21 Days
NO-BID	NO-BID	NO-BID	NO-BID
NO-BID	NO-BID	NO-BID	NO-BID
NO-BID	NO-BID	NO-BID	NO-BID
OLDCASTLE	183001	\$29.72	7-21 Days
OLDCASTLE	183002	\$32.50	7-21 Days
FORD	C32H-T	\$118.10	7-21 Days
Vestal	32-389	\$54.50	7-21 Days
Vestal	32-231	\$25.00	7-21 Days
Vestal	32-445	\$27.75	7-21 Days
Trumbull	367-5762	\$17.74	7-21 Days
SIP Industries	5351	\$33.75	7-21 Days
Trumbull	367-5464	\$26.85	7-21 Days
Vestal	32-294	\$59.00	7-21 Days
Vestal	32-092	\$42.00	7-21 Days
Vestal	32-478	\$175.95	7-21 Days
SIP Industries	6471	\$27.50	7-21 Days
SIP Industries	6472	\$34.75	7-21 Days
SIP Industries	6475	\$34.70	7-21 Days
SIP Industries	6476	\$56.80	7-21 Days
FORD	C22-33-NL	\$11.45	7-21 Days
FORD	C22-34-NL	\$16.94	7-21 Days
FORD	C28-31-NL	\$8.82	7-21 Days
FORD	C22-44-NL	\$20.11	7-21 Days
FORD	C02-34-NL	\$13.80	7-21 Days
FORD	L22-66-NL	\$86.16	7-21 Days
FORD	L22-77-NL	\$118.10	7-21 Days
FORD	C22-66-NL	\$60.25	7-21 Days
FORD	C22-77-NL	\$98.32	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-31-NL	\$7.84	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-34-NL	\$11.76	7-21 Days
FORD	C24-33-NL	\$17.05	7-21 Days

MANUFACTURER	CATALOG or PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
AY McDonald	3891	\$ 45.90	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	3895	\$ 46.76	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	3891	\$ 45.90	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	3855	\$ 71.99	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	3891	\$ 65.00	7-10 Days
NQ	NQ	NQ	NQ
AY McDonald	14-1	\$ 8.25	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74642BY	\$ 29.32	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74664BY	\$ 28.84	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74779Y	\$ 10.59	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74779FY	\$ 7.24	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	714-1EHG	\$ 12.67	7-10 Days
Ford	VBHC72-12W-MM	\$ 118.82	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	14-4	\$ 15.56	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74602BY	\$ 75.44	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74604BY	\$ 73.49	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74779Y	\$ 18.55	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74779FY	\$ 12.80	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	714-4EHG	\$ 23.00	7-10 Days
Ford	VBHC74-15W-MM-44-NL	\$ 234.87	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74602B	\$ 171.29	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74602B	\$ 218.42	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	665 setter	\$ 635.50	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	775 setter	\$ 714.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	7188615WW	\$ 836.98	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	7188715WW	\$ 913.00	7-10 Days
Buy Wholesale	3/4 gasket	\$ 0.30	7-10 Days
Buy Wholesale	1 gasket	\$ 0.11	7-10 Days
Buy Wholesale	1 1/2 gasket	\$ 1.02	7-10 Days
Buy Wholesale	2 gasket	\$ 1.15	7-10 Days
NQ	NQ	NQ	NQ
NQ	NQ	NQ	NQ
NQ	NQ	NQ	NQ
OldCastle	0018-3X	\$ 32.25	7-10 Days
OldCastle	0018-6X	\$ 35.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74132ARSTC	\$ 106.45	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74Q13ARSTC	\$ 50.35	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74MCL15T	\$ 26.51	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74MCL15TT	\$ 57.28	7-10 Days
DFW	Fox-1/WF	\$ 29.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	742232CT	\$ 47.78	7-10 Days
Ford	PMBC-318R	\$ 48.03	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74M4CT	\$ 100.79	7-10 Days
Ford	C4	\$ 84.21	7-10 Days
Vestal	32-478	\$ 185.70	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	742X1	\$ 60.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	742X3	\$ 180.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	742F100	\$ 130.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	742F1010	\$ 200.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758	\$ 11.48	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758	\$ 17.62	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753	\$ 8.87	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758	\$ 20.11	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755	\$ 14.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74761	\$ 85.88	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74761	\$ 118.36	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758	\$ 60.38	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758	\$ 98.53	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754	\$ 7.83	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754	\$ 11.76	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758CT	\$ 17.14	7-10 Days

MANUFACTURER	CATALOG or PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
FORD	570-803	\$ 49.00	21 DAYS
FORD	590-804	\$ 49.90	21 DAYS
FORD	570-804	\$ 49.00	21 DAYS
FORD	590-807	\$ 76.80	21 DAYS
FORD	570-807	\$ 69.40	21 DAYS
FORD	590-1203	\$ 145.50	21 DAYS
FORD	Y501	\$ 8.10	21 DAYS
FORD	BA92-213W	\$ 30.60	21 DAYS
FORD	BA91-213W	\$ 27.30	21 DAYS
FORD	L92-13-NL	\$ 10.06	21 DAYS
FORD	L91-13-NL	\$ 6.90	21 DAYS
FORD	EC-1	\$ 12.50	21 DAYS
FORD	VBHC72-12W-MM-33-NL	\$ 120.00	21 DAYS
FORD	Y504	\$ 15.70	21 DAYS
FORD	BA92-444W	\$ 78.40	21 DAYS
FORD	BA91-444W	\$ 69.70	21 DAYS
FORD	L92-44-NL	\$ 17.50	21 DAYS
FORD	L91-44-NL	\$ 12.12	21 DAYS
FORD	EC-4	\$ 24.40	21 DAYS
FORD	VBHC74-15W-MM-44-NL	\$ 230.60	21 DAYS
FORD	BFA-23-666W-NL	\$ 178.20	21 DAYS
FORD	BFA-23-777W-NL	\$ 227.20	21 DAYS
FORD	VB876-15B-11-66-NL	\$ 678.10	21 DAYS
FORD	VB877-15B-11-77-NL	\$ 761.80	21 DAYS
FORD	VB846-14B-NL	\$ 956.10	21 DAYS
FORD	VB847-14B-NL	\$ 1,042.20	21 DAYS
NO BID		\$	
NO BID		\$	
NO BID		\$	
NO BID			

Note: All blanks on this sheet shall be completed by printing or by typewriter. A bid price shall be indicated for each item listed or the words "No Bid" or "Not Applicable" entered. NO HANDWRITTEN BIDS WILL BE ACCEPTED.

2015 Bid Item #	2018 Bid Item #	Part ID	QTY	UNIT	TOTAL QTY	ITEM
122	117	NO #	500	10	510	3/4" Copper x 1" CTS Compression
123	118	395	100	100	100	3/4" Copper to Iron (male)
124	119	13	20	20	20	1" Copper to Iron (male)
125	120	127	100	100	100	1-1/2" Copper to Iron (male)
126	121	122	5	5	5	1-1/2" Copper to Iron (male)
127	122	247	60	60	60	1" Copper to Iron (male)
128	123	903	5	5	5	1" Compression to Iron (male)
129	124	394	30	30	30	3/4" Copper to Iron (female)
130	125	12	10	10	10	1" Copper to Iron (female)
131	126	36	100	10	110	1" Copper x Copper 90
132	127	126	10	10	10	1-1/2" Copper to Iron (female)
133	128	246	30	30	30	1" Copper to Iron (female)
134	129	383	3000	500	1500	3/4" Compression x Compression
135	130	9	50	100	150	1" Compression x Compression
136	131	118	10	10	10	1-1/2" Compression to Compression
137	132	47	10	10	20	1" Compression x Compression
138	133	134	20	20	20	1-1/2" Flare Nut x F.I.P.
139	134	255	20	20	20	1" Flare Nut x F.I.P.
140	135	32	200	200	200	3/4" x 5/8" Compression x Flare x strong
141	136	39	200	200	200	3/4" x 5/8" Compression x Flare x strong
142	137	396	500	500	500	3/4" x 5/8" Compression x Flare strong
143	138	397	100	100	100	3/4" Compression x Flare x strong
144	139	27	100	100	100	3/4" Compression x Flare x strong
145	140	84	10	10	10	1 1/2" Compression PVC x PVC
146	141	136	10	10	10	1 1/2" Compression PEP x CTS
147	142	85	10	10	10	1 1/2" Compression PEP x PEP
148	143	83	10	10	10	1 1/2" Compression PVC x CTS
149	144	121	25	25	25	1 1/2" CTS Compression x PIP
150	145	80	10	10	10	1" Compression PVC x CTS
151	146	73	10	10	10	1" Compression PVC x PVC
152	147	81	10	10	10	1" Compression PEP x PVC
153	148	74	10	10	10	1" Compression PEP x PEP
154	149	242	100	100	100	1" CTS Compression x PIP
155	150	905	50	50	50	5/8" Angle Valve x CTS (Compression Ball Type)
156	151	389	50	50	50	1" Copper Flare x 1" MIP
157	152	43	50	50	50	1" Copper Flare x 1" XX Strong Lead
158	153	44	50	50	50	1" Copper Flare x 1" Strong Lead
159	154	417	50	20	70	1" CTS Compression x 1" CTS Compression
160	155	82	25	25	25	1" Copper Flare x 1" XX Strong Lead
161	156	275	25	25	25	1" Copper Flare x 1" Strong Lead
162	157	2000	2000	2000	2000	3/4" Dielectric Fittings
163	158	100	100	100	100	1" Dielectric Fittings
164	159	100	100	100	100	3/4" Female Copper Thread x 1/4" CTS Quick Joint
165	160	50	50	50	50	1" Female Copper Thread x 1" CTS Quick Joint
166	161	BCW	1500	1500	1500	3/4" Setter End Connection - Compression x PIP
167	162	BCW	100	100	100	1" Setter End Connection - Flare Nut x PIP
168	163	BCW	100	100	100	1" Setter End Connection - Compression x PIP
169	164	BCW	25	25	25	1" Setter End Connection - Flare Nut x PIP
170	165	BCW	50	50	50	1" Setter End Connection - Compression x MIP
171	166	401	100	5	105	3/4" Ball Valve Flare X Flare
172	167	402	5	5	5	1/4" Ball Valve I.P. X Flare
173	168	403	10	10	10	1/4" Ball Valve F.I.P. X F.I.P.
174	169	20	35	35	35	1" Ball Valve Copper x F.I.P.
175	170	54	100	10	110	1" x 3/4" x 3/4" Flare Tee
176	171	19	20	30	30	1" Curb Stop Copper x Copper
177	172	296	20	20	20	1" Compression x 1" CC Tee
178	173	130	5	5	5	1 1/2" Ball Valve Copper x Copper
179	174	131	5	5	5	1 1/2" Ball Valve Copper x F.I.P.
180	175	132	5	5	5	1 1/2" Ball Valve F.I.P. X F.I.P.
181	176	252	10	10	10	1" Ball Valve I.P. X Flare
182	177	253	50	50	50	1" Ball Valve (Inside I.P.)

MANUFACTURER	CATALOG or PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
FORD	C24-34-NL	\$18.05	7-21 Days
FORD	C28-33-NL	\$9.25	7-21 Days
FORD	C28-44-NL	\$13.00	7-21 Days
FORD	C84-66Q-NL	\$33.08	7-21 Days
FORD	C84-66-NL	\$33.08	7-21 Days
FORD	C28-77-NL	\$73.25	7-21 Days
FORD	C84-77-NL	\$48.22	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-33-NL	\$8.95	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-44-NL	\$13.73	7-21 Days
FORD	L22-33-NL	\$12.25	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-66-NL	\$36.98	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-77-NL	\$69.97	7-21 Days
FORD	C44-33-NL	\$12.39	7-21 Days
FORD	C44-44-NL	\$14.18	7-21 Days
FORD	C44-66-NL	\$47.55	7-21 Days
FORD	C44-77-NL	\$64.18	7-21 Days
FORD	C-21-66-NL	\$33.77	7-21 Days
FORD	C-21-77-NL	\$69.81	7-21 Days
FORD	Q12-33/Q12-23-NL	\$19.08	7-21 Days
FORD	C26-33/Q22-23-NL	\$17.84	7-21 Days
FORD	Q12-23/Q12-13-NL	\$19.49	7-21 Days
FORD	Q12-33-NL	\$26.59	7-21 Days
FORD	C26-33-NL	\$17.85	7-21 Days
FORD	C77-66-NL	\$60.30	7-21 Days
FORD	Q24-66-C46-66-IDR7-NL	\$67.95	7-21 Days
FORD	C66-66-IDR7-NL	\$67.98	7-21 Days
FORD	C47-66-NL	\$65.79	7-21 Days
FORD	C14-66-NL	\$42.58	7-21 Days
FORD	C47-77-NL	\$76.83	7-21 Days
FORD	C77-77-NL	\$91.45	7-21 Days
FORD	C57-77-NL	\$76.93	7-21 Days
FORD	C66-77-IDR7-NL	\$91.52	7-21 Days
FORD	C14-77-NL	\$50.39	7-21 Days
FORD	BA21-333W-NL	\$46.35	7-21 Days
FORD	C28-34-NL	\$10.47	7-21 Days
FORD	Q12-23-Q12-13-NL	\$19.56	7-21 Days
FORD	C24-33-NL	\$17.11	7-21 Days
FORD	C44-34-NL	\$14.40	7-21 Days
FORD	Q32-44-NL	\$35.90	7-21 Days
FORD	Q12-44-NL	\$39.82	7-21 Days
FORD	SI-3-NL	\$23.54	7-21 Days
FORD	SI-4-NL	\$34.65	7-21 Days
FORD	C04-33-Q-NL	\$11.58	7-21 Days
FORD	C04-44-Q-NL	\$17.04	7-21 Days
FORD	C14-33-Q-NL	\$10.70	7-21 Days
FORD	C-21-33-NL	\$8.98	7-21 Days
FORD	C14-44-Q-NL	\$14.60	7-21 Days
FORD	C21-44-NL	\$13.59	7-21 Days
FORD	C84-77-Q-NL	\$48.22	7-21 Days
FORD	B22-333-NL	\$45.61	7-21 Days
FORD	B84-333-NL	\$43.62	7-21 Days
FORD	B11-333-NL	\$35.21	7-21 Days
FORD	B21-444-NL	\$58.42	7-21 Days
FORD	T222-443-NL	\$25.75	7-21 Days
FORD	B22-444-NL	\$63.01	7-21 Days
FORD	T440-774-NL	\$77.40	7-21 Days
FORD	B22-666-NL	\$153.31	7-21 Days
FORD	B21-666-NL	\$133.12	7-21 Days
FORD	B11-666-NL	\$111.50	7-21 Days
FORD	B21-777-NL	\$194.45	7-21 Days
FORD	B11-777-NL	\$162.95	7-21 Days

MANUFACTURER	CATALOG or PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
AY McDonald	74758CT	\$ 17.85	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753	\$ 9.09	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753	\$ 13.00	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753	\$ 40.05	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753T	\$ 33.18	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753	\$ 73.51	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753T	\$ 48.34	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754	\$ 8.99	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754	\$ 13.75	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74761	\$ 12.25	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754	\$ 36.88	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754	\$ 70.12	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 12.45	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 14.25	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 47.65	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 64.36	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755S	\$ 26.70	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755S	\$ 45.76	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C	\$ 19.15	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C	\$ 17.93	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C	\$ 19.60	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C	\$ 26.66	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C	\$ 22.63	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758-44	\$ 60.26	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758T-33	\$ 65.56	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758-33	\$ 67.70	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758T-44	\$ 65.58	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754T	\$ 42.44	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754T-44	\$ 76.56	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758-44	\$ 91.15	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758-33-44	\$ 91.20	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758-33	\$ 91.23	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74754T	\$ 50.53	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74642HT	\$ 30.95	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74753	\$ 10.48	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C-68	\$ 19.60	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	NQ	\$	
AY McDonald	74758T	\$ 14.46	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C-68	\$ 35.98	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74758C-66	\$ 39.90	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755DBL	\$ 21.68	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755DBL	\$ 32.51	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755Q	\$ 11.65	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74755Q	\$ 17.10	7-10 Days
Ford	C14-33QNL	\$ 11.39	7-10 Days
Ford	C21-33NL	\$ 9.34	7-10 Days
Ford	C14-44QNL	\$ 15.19	7-10 Days
Ford	C21-44NL	\$ 14.29	7-10 Days
Ford	C84-77QNL	\$ 50.30	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76100	\$ 45.78	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76102	\$ 41.50	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76101	\$ 35.30	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76102	\$ 58.60	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	74760	\$ 25.80	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76100	\$ 63.41	7-10 Days
NQ	NQ	NQ	NQ
AY McDonald	76100	\$ 151.57	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76102	\$ 132.67	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76101	\$ 111.71	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76102	\$ 194.81	7-10 Days
AY McDonald	76101	\$ 163.39	7-10 Days

MANUFACTURER	CATALOG or PART #	UNIT PRICE	DELIVERY TIME (IN CAL. DAYS)
FORD	C24-34-QNL	\$ 19.20	21 DAYS
FORD	C28-33-NL	\$ 9.60	21 DAYS
FORD	C28-44-NL	\$ 13.80	21 DAYS
FORD	C28-66-NL	\$ 42.50	21 DAYS
FORD	C84-66-QNL	\$ 35.25	21 DAYS
FORD	C-28-77-NL	\$ 78.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C84-77-QNL	\$ 51.30	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-33-NL	\$ 9.50	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-44-NL	\$ 14.50	21 DAYS
FORD	L22-33-NL	\$ 13.00	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-66-NL	\$ 39.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-77-NL	\$ 74.30	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-33-QNL	\$ 13.20	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-44-QNL	\$ 15.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-66-QNL	\$ 50.60	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-77-QNL	\$ 68.30	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-66-NL	\$ 39.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-77-NL	\$ 74.30	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-33-NL	\$ 13.20	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-44-NL	\$ 15.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-66-NL	\$ 50.60	21 DAYS
FORD	C44-77-NL	\$ 68.30	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-66-NL	\$ 39.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-77-NL	\$ 74.30	21 DAYS
FORD	Q12-33-NL	\$ 19.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C26-33-NL	\$ 18.88	1-10 DAYS
FORD	Q12-23-NL	\$ 20.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	Q32-33-NL	\$ 26.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C26-33-NL	\$ 18.49	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C77-66-NL	\$ 59.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C46-66-NL	\$ 66.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C66-66-NL	\$ 67.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C47-66-NL	\$ 65.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C14-66-NL	\$ 42.93	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C47-77-NL	\$ 76.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C77-77-NL	\$ 92.00	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C57-77-NL	\$ 76.98	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C66-77-NL	\$ 91.98	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C14-77-QNL	\$ 53.60	21 DAYS
FORD	BA94-213-QNL	\$ 32.80	21 DAYS
FORD	C28-34-QNL	\$ 11.20	21 DAYS
FORD	Q12-23-NL	\$ 20.35	1-10 DAYS
FORD	Q22-13-NL	\$ 98	1-10 DAYS
FORD	C44-34-NL	\$ 14.99	1-10 DAYS
FORD	Q32-44-NL	\$ 36.55	1-10 DAYS
FORD	Q12-44-NL	\$ 40.42	1-10 DAYS
FORD	SI-3-NL	\$ 24.40	21 DAYS
FORD	SI-4-NL	\$ 36.20	21 DAYS
FORD	C04-33-QNL	\$ 12.30	21 DAYS
FORD	C04-44-QNL	\$ 18.10	21 DAYS
FORD	C14-33-QNL	\$ 11.40	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-33-NL	\$ 9.50	21 DAYS
FORD	C14-44-QNL	\$ 15.50	21 DAYS
FORD	C21-44-NL	\$ 14.60	21 DAYS
FORD	C84-77-QNL	\$ 51.37	21 DAYS
FORD	B22-333-NL	\$ 47.60	21 DAYS
FORD	B82-333-NL	\$ 46.20	21 DAYS
FORD	B11-333-NL	\$ 37.30	21 DAYS
FORD	B21-444-NL	\$ 62.20	

